Amphitheater Public Schools
RFB 12-10-2019 Paper Products

SPICERS PAPER INC.

Tabulation

STAPLES CONTRACT & COMMERCIAL LLC

8.5x11 8.5x11
60# Parchment Per M 60# Parchment Per M
Aged Brown $24.24 Aged Brown No Bid
Antique Gold $24.24 Antique Gold No Bid
Britannia Blue $24.24 Britannia Blue No Bid
Natural Cream $24.24 Natural Cream No Bid
Parche Pink $24.24 Parche Pink No Bid
Pewter Gray $24.24 Pewter Gray No Bid
Spring Green $24.24 Spring Green No Bid
60# Astrobright Bright ?’::ﬂ Fl’i:ll\jl 60# Astrobright Bright ?’:::l& ;2:1'\;
Lunar Blue $14.37 $28.77 |Lunar Blue $26.10 No Bid
Celestial Blue $14.37 $28.77 _|Celestial Blue No Bid No Bid
Terrestial Green $14.37 $28.77 | Terrestial Green No Bid No Bid
Cosmic Orange $14.37 $28.77 |Cosmic Orange No Bid No Bid
Electric Pink $14.37 $28.77 _|Electric Pink No Bid No Bid
Lift Off Lemon $14.37 $28.77 _|Lift Off Lemon No Bid No Bid
Terra Green $14.37 $28.77 _|Fireball Fuchsia No Bid No Bid
Planetary Purple $14.37 $28.77 | Terra Green No Bid No Bid
Re-Entry Red $14.37 $28.77 _|Planetary Purple No Bid No Bid
Solar Yellow $14.37 $28.77 |Re-Entry Red No Bid $54.22
Terrestial Teal $14.37 $28.77 |Solar Yellow $25.05 No Bid
Fireball Fuchsia $14.37 $28.77 | Terrestial Teal $25.05 $41.89
5 8.5x11 11x17 q 8.5x11 11x17
65# Astrobright Per M per M 65# Astrobright Per M per M
Lunar Blue $28.46 $56.95 |Lunar Blue $31.96 No Bid
Celestial Blue $28.46 $56.95 | Celestial Blue $31.96 No Bid
Terrestial Green $28.46 $56.95 [Terrestial Green $31.96 No Bid
Cosmic Orange $28.46 $56.95 |Cosmic Orange $31.96 No Bid
Electric Pink $28.46 $56.95 |Electric Pink No Bid No Bid
Lift Off Lemon $28.46 $56.95 | Lift Off Lemon $31.96 No Bid
Terra Green $28.46 $56.95 |Fireball Fuchsia No Bid No Bid
Planetary Purple $28.46 $56.95 |Terra Green $31.96 No Bid
Re-Entry Red $28.46 $56.95 |Planetary Purple $31.96 No Bid
Solar Yellow $28.46 $56.95 |Re-Entry Red $31.96 No Bid
Terrestial Teal $28.46 $56.95 |Solar Yellow $31.96 $113.16
Fireball Fuchsia $28.46 $56.95 | Terrestial Teal $31.96 No Bid
8.5x11 11x17 8.5x11 11x17
Gl Per M Per M Cliier Per M Per M
MacTac White $117.80 No Bid [MacTac White No Bid No Bid
Flourescent Red MacTac $244.90 No Bid _|Flourescent Red MacTac No Bid No Bid
Chipboard 8.5x11*** $15.93 No Bid _[Flourescent Orange MacTac No Bid No Bid
Chipboard 11x17*** $16.73 No Bid | Chartreuse Yellow MacTac No Bid No Bid
24# Writing Gray Fiber $26.00 No Bid _[Flourescent Green No Bid No Bid
80# Cover Gray Fiber $63.38 No Bid |80# Passport Gray (Royal Sundance) No Bid No Bid
4 Part Digital Forward $25.38 No Bid |24# Passport Gray (Royal Sundance) No Bid No Bid
3 Part Digital Forward $23.75 No Bid |28# Domtar 98 Brite White $29.91 $56.92
2 Part Digital Reverse $21.12 No Bid |80# Everyday Digital White Coated Gloss Text No Bid No Bid
Flourescent Orange MacTac $244.90 No Bid |80# Everyday Digital White Coated Gloss Cover $41.68 No Bid
Chartuse Yellow MacTac $244.90 No Bid |24# Writing Gray Fiber No Bid No Bid
Flourescent Green $244.90 No Bid |80# Cover Gray Fiber No Bid No Bid
80# Passport Gray $63.38 No Bid |4 Part Digital Forward No Bid No Bid
244# Passport Gray $26.00 No Bid |3 Part Digital Forward No Bid No Bid
28# Domtar 98 Brite White $19.12 $38.24 |2 Part Digital Reverse No Bid No Bid
80# Everyday Digitial White Coated Gloss Text $15.67 $30.00 |Chipboard 8.5 X 11 $0.04/Each | No Bid
80# Everyday Digitial White Coated Gloss Covel|  $29.32 $56.00 [Chipboard 11 X 17 $0.07/Each | No Bid
Carbonless Fan Apart Adhesive $155.75 No Bid |Carbonless Fan Apart Adhesive (Gallon) $191.18 No Bid
Printer's Choice Padding Cement $12.30/Qt No Bid |Printer's Choice Padding Cement (Quart) $42.80 No Bid
Boxes Bundle Boxes Bundle
200# Test RSC Corrugated Carton Brown Kraft 200# Test RSC Corrugated Carton Brown Kraft
11 1/4" x 8 3/4" x 6" boxes $1050 11 1/4" x 8 3/4" x 6" boxes $0.58/Each
200# Test RSC Corrugated Carton Brown Kraft $12.60 200# Test RSC Corrugated Carton Brown Kraft $0.55/Each

11 1/4" x 8 3/4" x 12" boxes

11 1/4" x 8 3/4" x 12" boxes




